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NEW HOUSE!
I have moved yet again, this time to a happnin'
70's disco pad! Check out my hot tub!

3200 square feet with five bedrooms and I still
don't have room for all my toys! Wah!

My old house is for sale if anyone is thinking of
moving to Portland! I'll give ya such a deal! 1500
sqft +600 sqft unfinished basement! Mahogany
paneling and wood floors! Remote controlled
lighting and wired for surround sound!

New address:

Mike Shkolnik
7025 SW Ventura Drive

Tigard, OR 97223

NEW JOB!
After 2.5years at Hollywood Video Headquarters,
where I received this award

and a leather jacket for being so darned special, I
was laid off!

I just started work at Timberline Software as a
project manager and it's a cool place. My new boss
has skulls tattooed on his arm and they don't make
him cover them up!



WEB UPDATE!

BROCCOLI MAN!

I have added much to my web site, including over
70 different eyeball toys now available in the Plastic
Eyeball Museum gift shop! And of course, there's
always...

Not only did Broccoli Man perform live at a REAL
club, but he also has been on the news YET
AGAIN! This time with presidential candidate
George W. Bush! But Broccoli Man's fame doesn't
end there! Broccoli Man was interviewed on live
Internet radio by Susan Olsen, aka Cindy Brady!
Check out the web site for news footage and the
live radio interview!
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HALLOWEEN '99!
1999 was a good year for Halloween. Although I
didn't visit 26 haunted houses like I did in '98, I
did go to five Halloween parties, three of them in
one night! I did two costumes this year. At work I
was the Blair Sandwich Project...

But that giant sandwich was too cumbersome, so
five minutes before leaving for a party, I shed the
bread, sharpened a broken shovel handle, stapled
some ribbon to it, and became Olive Man! With his
mighty frilly toothpick!

HEARSE SOLD!
After 10 years of owning my classic 1964 Buick
hearse, it has been sold to a very good home.
Here's one last look.


